
 

Curriculum Map – Art – Year 7 
 

“Perseverance produces character, and character, hope” (Romans 5:4) 

 

 
Half term 1 Half term 2 Half term 3 Half term 4 Half term 5 Half term 6 

Key focus Basic skills  
 
 

Basic skills  Basic skills  Fantasy Animals  Fantasy Animals  Fantasy Animals   

Key knowledge 
and skills 

• mark making  

• line drawing  

• tone  
 

• scale and proportion  

• cross hatching  

• primary/secondary colour, 
colour mixing  

• understanding of blending 
different media  

• understand warm/ cold/ 
complementary/ 
primary/secondary/ muted 
colours   

• textured drawing  

• intricate detailed insect 
design  

• translate your knowledge 
of tone and mark making to 
create an accurate insect 
design  
 

• A detailed animal drawing 
showing proportion, tone 
and texture.  

• develop blending 
techniques with ink 
washes  

• produce an intricate 
detailed animal design by 
using texture.  
 

• develop Mark making 
techniques using sgraffito 
technique  

• develop an understanding 
of collage  

• develop an understanding 
of Composition 

Key words/ 
vocabulary 

Smooth, direction, shape, 
scale, tone, light and dark, 
colour, mix, blend, smooth, 
light, dark, fade, short, 
straight, light, dark,  
 

Proportion, mix, primary, 
secondary, rough, broken, 
dotted, thin, spiral, thick, 
curved, varied, long, parallel, 
wavy, curly, zig-zag, texture, 
rough,  

Fragment, complimentary, 
tapered, ratio, horizontal, 
spiral, varied, long, parallel,  
diagonal, vertical, straight, 
cross-hatch, scale, tone, light 
and dark, proportion,  

Texture, intricate, theme, 
detail, translate, modify, 
design, hybrid, tone, hatching, 
mark making.  

Proportion, tone, texture, 
blending, ink wash, texture, 
creative,   

Literacy: Use speaking and 
listening to plan writing – this 
can be paired, in groups, 
whole class  

Assessment 
method 

Assessment of classwork 
and homework  

End of term assessment 
based on multiple choice 
questions and a drawing.  
 

Assessment of classwork and 
homework  

End of term assessment 
based on multiple choice 
questions and a drawing.  

Assessment of classwork and 
homework  

End of term assessment 
based on multiple choice 
questions and a drawing.  

Wider links Numeracy   
Language  

Numeracy   
Language  

Numeracy   
Language  

Literacy: Use connectives or 
conjunctions to support writing 
– learn what they mean and 
how to spell them  
 

Numeracy   
Language  
Biology looking into different 
species.  

Numeracy: use calculations 
for presentation and 
measurements for the layout 
of the page  

Enrichment 
opportunities 
 
 

https://www.youtube.com/
watch?v=ewMksAbgdBI  

  https://www.youtube.com/watc
h?v=nDe7kHa6MVo  

  https://www.youtube.com/watc
h?v=5Zc1xVS_X7Q  

  

Careers links 
 
 

Illustrator  Animator  Artist  Cartoonist  Designer  Graphic designer  
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